



Health & Human Services  
Agency  
COUNTY OF TULARE  
AGENDA ITEM

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

ALLEN ISHIDA  
District One

PETE VANDER POEL  
District Two

PHILLIP A. COX  
District Three

J. STEVEN WORTHLEY  
District Four

MIKE ENNIS  
District Five

**AGENDA DATE:** July 27, 2010 - REVISED

Public Hearing Required	Yes	<input type="checkbox"/>	No	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	N/A	<input type="checkbox"/>
Scheduled Public Hearing w/Clerk	Yes	<input type="checkbox"/>	No	<input type="checkbox"/>	N/A	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Published Notice Required	Yes	<input type="checkbox"/>	No	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	N/A	<input type="checkbox"/>
Advertised Published Notice	Yes	<input type="checkbox"/>	No	<input type="checkbox"/>	N/A	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Meet & Confer Required	Yes	<input type="checkbox"/>	No	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	N/A	<input type="checkbox"/>
Electronic file(s) has been sent	Yes	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	No	<input type="checkbox"/>	N/A	<input type="checkbox"/>
Budget Transfer (Aud 308) attached	Yes	<input type="checkbox"/>	No	<input type="checkbox"/>	N/A	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Personnel Resolution attached	Yes	<input type="checkbox"/>	No	<input type="checkbox"/>	N/A	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Resolution, Ordinance or Agreements are attached and signature line for Chairman is marked with tab(s)/flag(s) Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No <input type="checkbox"/> N/A <input type="checkbox"/>						
CONTACT PERSON: Amber Smith PHONE: 624-8000						

**SUBJECT:** Approval of the Application to the California Emergency Management Agency for the 2010 State Homeland Security Grant Program.

**REQUEST(S):**

That the Board of Supervisors:

1. Authorize the submittal of the application for the 2010 State Homeland Security Grant Program, not to exceed \$975,720 to enhance the ability to prepare for, prevent, respond to, and recover from terrorist attacks and other disasters; and
2. Authorize the Chairman of the Board to sign three (3) copies of the attached 2010 State Homeland Security Grant Resolution.

**SUMMARY:**

The California Emergency Management Agency is providing financial assistance to each county through the State Homeland Security Grant Program for 2010. The purpose of the Homeland Security Grant Program (HSGP) is to enhance the ability of state, local and tribal governments to prepare for, prevent, respond to and recover from terrorist attacks and other disasters. The HSGP is a primary funding mechanism for building and sustaining national preparedness capabilities. The amount of this grant is \$975,720. The HSGP provides funding for planning, equipment, training, and exercises. Funding will be passed through to various fire services, law enforcement agencies, emergency medical services, and others for

**SUBJECT:** Approval of the Application to the California Emergency Management Agency for the 2010 State Homeland Security Grant Program.

**DATE:** July 27, 2010

training, planning, exercises and the purchase of preparedness equipment throughout the Tulare County Operational Area. The Tulare County Office of Emergency Services will manage and administer the grant.

**FISCAL IMPACT/FINANCING:**

The grant amount of \$975,720 for the 2010 State Homeland Security Grant Program will be included in the proposed Fiscal Year 2010/2011 County budget. No Net County Cost.

**LINKAGE TO THE COUNTY OF TULARE STRATEGIC BUSINESS PLAN:**

The County's five-year strategic plan includes the Safety and Security to plan and provide coordinated emergency preparedness, response, recovery and mitigation capabilities for both natural and man-made disasters. The approval of the Year 2010 State Homeland Security Grant Program helps fulfill this initiative by ensuring that emergency preparedness, response, recovery, and mitigation is coordinated by the Tulare County Office of Emergency Services.

**ALTERNATIVES:**

The Board could choose not to approve this grant application, but this is not recommended because of the history of emergencies in Tulare County and the requirements of Homeland Security Presidential Directives.

**INVOLVEMENT OF OTHER DEPARTMENTS OR AGENCIES:**

Tulare County Sheriff's Office; Tulare County Fire Department; Municipal Police Departments; Municipal Fire Departments.

**ADMINISTRATIVE SIGN-OFF:**



---

Kevin Marks  
Director Administration

Cc: Auditor/Controller  
County Counsel  
County Administrative Office (3)

Attachment A – Grant Application

Attachment B – Grant Resolution

**BEFORE THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS  
COUNTY OF TULARE, STATE OF CALIFORNIA**

**IN THE MATTER OF:** )  
Approval of the Application to the )  
California Emergency Management )  
Agency for the 2010 State Homeland )  
Security Grant Program. )

**RESOLUTION NO.** \_\_\_\_\_  
**AGREEMENT NO.** \_\_\_\_\_

UPON MOTION OF SUPERVISOR \_\_\_\_\_, SECONDED BY  
SUPERVISOR \_\_\_\_\_, THE FOLLOWING WAS ADOPTED BY THE  
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS, AT AN OFFICIAL MEETING HELD \_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_, BY THE FOLLOWING VOTE:

AYES:  
NOES:  
ABSTAIN:  
ABSENT:

ATTEST: JEAN M. ROUSSEAU  
COUNTY ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICER/  
CLERK, BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

BY: \_\_\_\_\_  
Deputy Clerk

\* \* \* \* \*

1. Authorized the submittal of the application for the 2010 State Homeland Security Grant Program, not to exceed \$975,720 to enhance the ability to prepare for, prevent, respond to, and recover from terrorist attacks and other disasters; and
2. Authorized the Chairman of the Board to sign three (3) copies of the attached 2010 State Homeland Security Grant Resolution.

RESOLUTION NO. \_\_\_\_\_

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE \_\_\_\_\_ Board of Supervisors \_\_\_\_\_

OF THE \_\_\_\_\_ County of Tulare \_\_\_\_\_ THAT

\_\_\_\_\_ Emergency Services Director \_\_\_\_\_, OR

\_\_\_\_\_ Emergency Services Coordinator \_\_\_\_\_, OR

\_\_\_\_\_ Emergency Services Manager \_\_\_\_\_,

is hereby authorized to execute for and on behalf of the named applicant, a public entity established under the laws of the State of California, any actions necessary for the purpose of obtaining federal financial assistance provided by the federal Department of Homeland Security and sub-granted through the State of California.

Passed and approved this \_\_\_\_\_ 27th \_\_\_\_\_ day of \_\_\_\_\_ July \_\_\_\_\_, 2010 \_\_\_\_\_

**Certification**

I, \_\_\_\_\_ J. Steve Worthley \_\_\_\_\_, duly appointed and

\_\_\_\_\_ Chairman \_\_\_\_\_ of the \_\_\_\_\_ Board of Supervisors \_\_\_\_\_

do hereby certify that the above is a true and correct copy of a resolution passed and approved by the

\_\_\_\_\_ 27th \_\_\_\_\_ day of \_\_\_\_\_ July \_\_\_\_\_, 2010 \_\_\_\_\_

\_\_\_\_\_ Chairman of the Board of Supervisors \_\_\_\_\_  
(Official Position)

\_\_\_\_\_ (Signature)

\_\_\_\_\_ July 27, 2010 \_\_\_\_\_  
(Date)

**CALIFORNIA EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY  
GRANT APPLICATION COVER SHEET**

Application for the State Homeland Security Grant Program (SHSGP) is subject to the following conditions:  
1. The applicant must be a local government or a special district.  
2. The applicant must be a public agency.  
3. The applicant must be a public agency.  
4. The applicant must be a public agency.

CFDA #: 97.067

1. Applicant Name:	Tulare County
2. FIPS #:	107-00000
3. Date:	July 8, 2010
4. Grant Number:	2010
5. Program Section:	State Homeland Security Grant Program (SHSGP)
6. Amount Requested:	\$ 975,720
7. FOR YEAR:	2010

Approval Agreement by \_\_\_\_\_  
 Date: \_\_\_\_\_  
 For State Use only

Authorized Body of S. Signature and contact information	Signature	Printed Name	Title	Designator Y/N	Phone	Email
County Public Health Officer		Ray Bullick	Health Director	N	(559) 624-8480	rbullick@tularecshsa.org
County Fire Chief		Steve Sunderland	Fire Chief	N	(559) 747-8233	sundersland@co.tulare.ca.us
Municipal Fire Chief		Michael Threlkeld	Fire Chief, City of Tulare	N	(559) 684-4301	mthrelkeld@ci.tulare.ca.us
County Sheriff		David Williams	Captain	N	(559) 733-6233	dwilliams@co.tulare.ca.us
Chief of Police		David Williams	Police Chief, City of Hanford	N	(559) 782-7430	dwilliams@ci.hanford.ca.us
Additional Position (Optional)						
Additional Position (Optional)						

Authorized Agent contact information	Authorized Agent's Name	Title	Working Address	City	State	Zip	Phone	Email
	Amber Smith	Emergency Services Manager	5957 S. Mooney Blvd.	Visalia	CA	93277	(559) 624-7497	asmith@tularecshsa.org
	Kevin Marks	Emergency Services Coordinator	5957 S. Mooney Blvd.	Visalia	CA	93277	(559) 624-8011	kmarts@tularecshsa.org
	Jean Rousseau	Emergency Services Director	2800 W. Burtel Ave.	Visalia	CA	93291	(559) 636-5005	jrousseau@co.tulare.ca.us
	Amber Smith	Emergency Services Manager	5957 S. Mooney Blvd.	Visalia	CA	93277	(559) 624-7497	asmith@tularecshsa.org
	Amy Raymond	Administrative Aide	5957 S. Mooney Blvd.	Visalia	CA	93277	(559) 624-7496	araymond@tularecshsa.org
	Andrew Lockman	Emergency Services Specialist	5957 S. Mooney Blvd.	Visalia	CA	93277	(559) 624-7498	alockman@tularecshsa.org

18. Statements of Certification  
**Statement of Certification-Approval Authority Body - SHSGP only**  
 By signing below, I hereby certify that the Operational Area's application represents the Approval Authority's consensus on the Operational Area's Homeland Security Grant Program needs for the State Homeland Security Grant Program.  
 Select Application Type: NSGP, TA, SA, UASI, OA -> **OA**

Statement of Certification - County Authorized Agent - By signing below, I hereby certify I am the duly appointed Authorized Agent and have the authority to apply for this Grant Program and the Operational Area's application represents the needs for this Grant Program.

11. Authorized Agent Name/Signature/Date	Signature	Date
Kevin Marks		Thursday, July 08, 2010

CALIFORNIA EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY

GRANT MANAGEMENT

AGREEMENT FOR THE EMPLOYMENT FROM FUNDING TO DELIVERER OPERATIONS, MODIFICATION OF EMPLOYEE-EMPLOYER AGREEMENT, SUPERVISORS ONLY FOR EMERGENCY AND OR RE-SIGNED AND ABOVE FINANCIAL ADMINISTRATION ACTIONS W/EMPLOYEES

CFDA #: 97.067

Tulare County

107-00000  
 July 8, 2010  
 2010

Name	Title	Area of Responsibility	Employee/Contractor	Employee Status
Amber Smith	Management	Grant Management	Employee	Full Time
Amy Raymond	Administrator	Grant Administration	Employee	Full Time
Andrew Lockman	Support Staff	Logistics	Employee	Full Time
Clarke Leal-Barnett	Accountant	Fiscal	Employee	Full Time
Kevin Marks	Management	Grant Management	Employee	Full Time
Jean Rousseau	Management	Grant Management	Employee	Full Time

CALIFORNIA EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY

PROJECT DESCRIPTIONS

Agencies to this program may benefit through application approval, participation in training exercises, and other emergency management activities.

CFDA #: 97.067

Tulare County

107-00000  
July 8, 2010  
2010

Project	State Investment, Investment Goals and Objectives	Project Description	Need	Project Progress & Next Steps
Project A	Investment 2 Goal 3 Objective 3.7	This project will strengthen medical preparedness and response through the purchase of an oxygen cylinder filling system to be used by any requesting fire agency in our OA, and the purchase of decontamination equipment for the Kernan Delta District Hospital (KDDH).	First responders rely on medical supply companies to provide oxygen when needed. In the event of disaster, the Tulare OA needs a reliable, secured supply of oxygen, which will be particularly critical if traditional suppliers are unable to deliver oxygen.  KDDH lacks a decontamination shower on site, so this equipment would enable KDDH to conduct necessary decontamination of patients in a safe and effective manner prior to treating contaminated victims.	At the 6 month mark, this project will be 50% complete and \$24,280 funds will be expended.  At the 12 month mark, this project will be 100% complete and \$48,560 funds will be expended.
Project B	Investment 3 Goal 1 Objective 1.1	This project will enhance interoperable and operable communications among all disciplines in the Tulare OA and with other jurisdictions throughout Mutual Aid Region V (Central Planning Area). This project includes purchasing the following equipment for various agencies and disciplines in the Tulare OA: repeater, base stations, mobile radios, and portable radios. This project also includes the enhancement of communications in our OA Unified Command Vehicle and to our OA Emergency Operations Center. Finally, this project includes the purchase of a simulcast voting repeater system which will be utilized by all disciplines and responders in the Tulare OA.	The purchase of a Med radio repeater will provide for a lack of radio coverage in the Three Rivers area and enable EMS and ambulance providers to effectively coordinate and manage emergencies and disasters. The purchase of base stations, mobile radios and portable radios will allow multiple fire and law enforcement agencies, as well as EOC personnel, to be interoperable with other agencies in the OA and other counties, meet narrow banding requirements and be digit capable. This project also provides for Internet and cellular phone connectivity for the OA command vehicle to ensure that these valuable resources are available to any agency requesting use of this vehicle.  The simulcast voting repeater system was identified as a key element by the Central Planning Area CalSIEC Working Group for establishing a baseline for reaching regional interoperable communications capability. The purchase of repeaters and related equipment will create lines of sight between repeaters where currently, this is	At the 6 month mark, this project will be 42% complete and \$151,974.00 funds will be expended.  At the 12 month mark, this project will be 66% complete and \$242,951.00 funds will be expended.  At the 18 month mark, this project will be 100% complete and \$366,712.00 funds will be expended.

Project	State Investment Justification Goals and Objectives	Project Description	Need	Project Milestone & Justifications
Project C	Investment Goal Objective	This project strengthens information technology capabilities through the purchase of computer aided dispatch hardware and software.	The Tulare Fire Department currently does not have the capability to receive call data, pre-plans or other vital information in the field. Additionally, the police department is handling their dispatch and they are not sufficiently trained. The purchase of computer aided dispatch (CAD) hardware and software will enable first responders to receive and respond to critical information quickly and effectively.	At the 6-month mark, this project will be 74% complete and \$98,000.00 funds will be expended. At the 12-month mark, this project will be 87% complete and \$114,849.00 funds will be expended. At the 18-month mark, this project will be 100% complete and \$131,705 funds will be expended.
Project D	Investment Goal Objective	This project will provide necessary personal protective equipment (PPE) to protect first responding fire fighters from hazards they face in the line of duty.	The Lindsay Department of Public Safety recently made a decision to dual-train all law enforcement officers as fire fighters to provide better service to its constituents. Dismal budgets for the city prevent the department from purchasing necessary PPE. The Porterville Fire Department faces requirements to replace self-contained breathing apparatus (SCBA) due to expiration and are under similar budget constraints. This equipment would provide the necessary protection for fire fighters, therefore enhancing their jurisdiction's incident and response capabilities.	At the 6-month mark, this project will be 100% complete and \$40,940.00 funds will be expended.
Project E	Investment Goal Objective	This project will provide for telephone emergency notification system (TENS) service for the Tulare Operational Area for one year.	The Tulare Operational Area currently lacks a sustainable funding source for its TENS system, AlertTC. The Cities and County lack the funds to cover this cost due to budget constraints. This system provides a critical service to our constituents by providing them with time-sensitive or critical information when any foreseeable threat approaches.	At the 6-month mark, this project will be 50% complete and \$58,290.00 funds will be expended. At the 12-month mark, this project will be 100% complete and \$116,580.00 funds will be expended.



Project	State Investment Justification Goals and Objectives	Project Description	Need	Project Milestone & Justifications
Project F	Investment Goal Objective	This project will enhance CBRNE detection and response capabilities with the purchase of a fixed-wing aircraft and aerial surveillance equipment for the Tulare County Sheriff's Office. This equipment would for daily patrol for all law enforcement agencies in the Tulare OA and provide for rapid response to terrorism incidents, threat and damage assessments and disaster training for first responders.	Tulare County is one of the top producing agricultural counties in the United States. This agricultural abundance makes the County a potential target for terrorists seeking to contaminate our food or water supply. These targets could include our two dams and a major canal system. These facilities supply irrigation water for farmers and drinking water for Los Angeles. The topography and size of our county make patrolling this area extremely difficult. This equipment will provide for an economical means for law enforcement to provide routine patrols which will help in identifying potential terrorist activity and in responding to large scale incidents.	At the 6-month mark, this project will be 0% complete and \$0.00 funds will be expended. At the 12-month mark, this project will be 100% complete and \$199,167.00 funds will be expended.
Project G	Investment Goal Objective	Tulare County will continue to strengthen emergency management capabilities in the Tulare OA through SEMS/NIMS/ICS and Executive-level SEMS/NIMS Training.	This project will address the ongoing need and requirements for first responders and EOC personnel to receive local, state and federal training. This training builds our OA's capabilities to effectively manage emergencies and disasters. The training to be funded in this project will provide the foundational knowledge necessary for first responders and EOC personnel to operate and coordinate within established emergency management systems.	At the 6-month mark, this project will be 25% complete and \$5,813.00 funds will be expended. At the 12-month mark, this project will be 50% complete and \$11,625.00 funds will be expended. At the 18-month mark, this project will be 75% complete and \$17,438.00 funds will be expended.

**CALIFORNIA EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY**

**PROJECT LEDGER**

*Approved to this document may result in changes to program, equipment, personnel, or funding. All changes must be approved by the project manager. All changes must be approved by the project manager. All changes must be approved by the project manager.*

**Tulare County**

107-00000  
July 8, 2010  
2010

**CFDA #** 97.067

**LEDGER TYPE:** Initial Application

**Today's Date:** Thursday, July 08, 2010

**Expenditure Period:** (Date) From: \_\_\_\_\_ (Date) To: \_\_\_\_\_

Item Number	Project	Project Name	Funding Source	Discipline	Solution Area	Solution Area Sub-Category	Total Obligated	Amount Approved Previous	Amount This Request	Match Amount	Total Approved	Remaining Balance	Percentage Complete
1	A	Strengthen Medical Health Preparedness	SHSGP	HM	Equip	Decontamination	975,720	-	-	-	-	975,720	-
2	A	Strengthen Medical Health Preparedness	SHSGP	EMS-F	Equip	Medical	27,535	-	-	-	-	27,535	-
3	A	Strengthen Medical Health Preparedness	SHSGP	EMG	M & A	All Other M&A Expenses	21,025	-	-	-	-	21,025	-
4	B	Enhance Interoperable and Operable Communications Capabilities	SHSGP	EMS	Equip	Interoperable Communications	2,556	-	-	-	-	2,556	-
5	B	Enhance Interoperable and Operable Communications Capabilities	SHSGP	FS	Equip	Equipment Interoperable Communications	21,912	-	-	-	-	21,912	-
6	B	Enhance Interoperable and Operable Communications Capabilities	SHSGP	LE	Equip	Equipment Interoperable Communications	9,885	-	-	-	-	9,885	-
7	B	Enhance Interoperable and Operable Communications Capabilities	SHSGP	LE	Equip	Equipment Interoperable Communications	305,666	-	-	-	-	305,666	-
8	B	Enhance Interoperable and Operable Communications Capabilities	SHSGP	EMG	Equip	Equipment Interoperable Communications	1,069	-	-	-	-	1,069	-
9	B	Enhance Interoperable and Operable Communications Capabilities	SHSGP	EMG	M & A	All Other M&A Expenses	28,180	-	-	-	-	28,180	-
10	C	Improve Information Technology Capabilities	SHSGP	FS	Equip	Information Technology	19,300	-	-	-	-	19,300	-
11	C	Improve Information Technology Capabilities	SHSGP	LE	Equip	Information Technology	119,305	-	-	-	-	119,305	-
12	C	Improve Information Technology Capabilities	SHSGP	EMG	M & A	All Other M&A Expenses	12,400	-	-	-	-	12,400	-
13	D	Personal Protective Equipment	SHSGP	FS	Equip	Personal Protective Equipment	6,932	-	-	-	-	6,932	-
14	D	Personal Protective Equipment	SHSGP	EMG	M & A	All Other M&A Expenses	40,940	-	-	-	-	40,940	-
15	E	Telephone Emergency Notification System	SHSGP	PCS	Equip	Interoperable Communications	2,154	-	-	-	-	2,154	-
16	E	Telephone Emergency Notification System	SHSGP	EMG	M & A	All Other M&A Expenses	116,580	-	-	-	-	116,580	-
17	F	Enhance CBRNE Detection and Response Capabilities	SHSGP	LE	Equip	Equipment	6,136	-	-	-	-	6,136	-
18	F	Enhance CBRNE Detection and Response Capabilities	SHSGP	EMG	M & A	CBRNE Avoidance Equipment	199,167	-	-	-	-	199,167	-
19	G	Tulare Operational Area Training	SHSGP	EMG	Train	All Other M&A Expenses	10,483	-	-	-	-	10,483	-
20	G	Tulare Operational Area Training	SHSGP	EMG	Train	Training Consultant	23,270	-	-	-	-	23,270	-
21	G	Tulare Operational Area Training	SHSGP	EMG	M & A	All Other M&A Expenses	1,225	-	-	-	-	1,225	-

CALIFORNIA EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY  
EQUIPMENT INVENTORY

CFDA# 97.067

ENTER TYPE	ENTER DATE
YEAR'S DATE	DATE FROM
EXPIRES	DATE TO

Project	Request Description & Quantity	ASAP	Alt. Title	Priority	Project/Status	Category	System (Int. Equip.)	Mobile	Vehicle	24 Hr. Available	Estimated Cost	Actual Cost	Approved Cost	Estimated Cost	Actual Cost	Approved Cost	Estimated Cost	Actual Cost
A	(2) Portable Decompression Shower	0802-03-SHR	Shower, Portable, 7500 Watts	NO	SHSGP	HM	Decompression				No bid indicated			13,695			13,695	
A	(7) Decompression Berms	0802-01-WMCD	Decompression Berms, 7500 Watts	NO	SHSGP	HM	Decompression				No bid indicated			3,075			3,075	
A	(10) Rhinny Curtains	0802-01-TC3	Rhinny Curtains, 7500 Watts	NO	SHSGP	HM	Decompression				No bid indicated			2,477			2,477	
A	(2) Water Heaters	0802-01-HTRW	Water Heaters, 7500 Watts	NO	SHSGP	HM	Decompression				No bid indicated			6,519			6,519	
A	(3) Decompression Water Pumps	0802-01-WMCD	Decompression Water Pumps, 7500 Watts	NO	SHSGP	HM	Decompression				No bid indicated			1,764			1,764	
A	(1) Medical Oxygen Generating System	09ME-02-OVE	Medical Oxygen Generating System, 7500 Watts	NO	SHSGP	EHS-F	Medical				No bid indicated			21,025			21,025	
B	(2) 3M UHF #23 Repetier	06C-01-RPT	3M UHF #23 Repetier	YES	SHSGP	EHS	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			21,912			21,912	
B	(1) 10-50W VHF XTL 5000 Converter	06C-01-BA2	10-50W VHF XTL 5000 Converter	YES	SHSGP	LE	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			13,700			13,700	
B	(9) Motorola XTL 5000 Mobile Radio	06C-01-MOR	Motorola XTL 5000 Mobile Radio	YES	SHSGP	LE	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			31,288			31,288	
B	(2) Motorola XTS 2500 Portable Radio	06C-01-POR	Motorola XTS 2500 Portable Radio	YES	SHSGP	LE	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			4,772			4,772	
B	(3) Motorola XTS 2500 Portable Radio	06C-01-POR	Motorola XTS 2500 Portable Radio	YES	SHSGP	LE	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			13,307			13,307	
B	(2) Motorola XTL 5000 Mobile Radio	06C-01-MOR	Motorola XTL 5000 Mobile Radio	YES	SHSGP	LE	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			6,500			6,500	
B	(1) Aerial Tower For 7500 Mobile	06C-02-ESA0	Aerial Tower For 7500 Mobile	NO	SHSGP	LE	Information Technology, Information Technology				No bid indicated			614			614	
B	(8) Motorola XTL 5000 Mobile Radio	06C-01-MOR	Motorola XTL 5000 Mobile Radio	YES	SHSGP	LE	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			60,790			60,790	
B	Installation of Berms	21GR-08-INT	Installation of Berms	NO	SHSGP	LE	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			1,600			1,600	
B	(8) ACU-1000 Interface Cable for Radio	06C-01-MOR	ACU-1000 Interface Cable for Radio	NO	SHSGP	LE	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			1,992			1,992	
B	(3) Dispatcher Switch Box with Foot Switch	06C-01-MOR	Dispatcher Switch Box with Foot Switch	NO	SHSGP	LE	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			3,942			3,942	
B	(12) Mobile Internet Service - Verizon	06C-01-ISA0	Mobile Internet Service - Verizon	NO	SHSGP	LE	Information Technology, Information Technology				No bid indicated			455			455	
B	ATA31 Go Phone Service	06C-01-CELL	ATA31 Go Phone Service	NO	SHSGP	LE	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			400			400	
B	(5) Trak GPS Reference Module	04AP-02-SGPS	Trak GPS Reference Module	NO	SHSGP	LE	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			121,097			121,097	
B	(1) Motorola Webtop Computer	06C-01-VOTR	Motorola Webtop Computer	YES	SHSGP	LE	Interpersonal Communications Equipment, Interpersonal Communications				No bid indicated			33,664			33,664	

Project	Equipment Description & Quantity	AB#	AGS Title	AGS Unit	AGS Status	AGS Source	Description	Station Area Sub-Category	Invoice Number	Header	ID Tag Number	Quantity	Current Inventory	Acquired Date	Hold Type	Approved Date	Estimated Cost	Amount Requested	Amount This Year Requested	Class Requested	Total Approved	Remaining Budget
C	Laptop Docking Station	04M-01-HOBL	Contractor Mobile Data Computer, Mobile LAN	NO	SHSGP	H5	Information Technology								No hold indicated		3,900				3,900	3,900
C	Manual Navigation Tablet PC Laptop	04M-01-HOBL	Contractor Mobile Data Computer, Mobile LAN	NO	SHSGP	F5	Information Technology								No hold indicated		33,800				33,800	33,800
C	Installation of Airborne and Equipment in Vehicle	21GM-00-3WST	Installation	NO	SHSGP	F5	Information Technology								GP		3,900				3,900	3,900
C	AVC Unit - GPS	04M-02-AMS	Systems, Automatic Vehicle Location	NO	SHSGP	F5	Information Technology								No hold indicated		11,500				11,500	11,500
C	RMS Mobile Maintenance	04M-01-CJOS	Systems, Automatic Vehicle Location	NO	SHSGP	F5	Information Technology								No hold indicated		2,500				2,500	2,500
C	RMS Mobile CAD Software	04M-01-CJOS	Systems, Automatic Vehicle Location	NO	SHSGP	F5	Information Technology								No hold indicated		14,500				14,500	14,500
C	Keeneland Navigation ePC Software	04M-01-CJOS	Systems, Automatic Vehicle Location	NO	SHSGP	F5	Information Technology								No hold indicated		29,200				29,200	29,200
C	ComptCAD Software	04M-01-CJOS	Systems, Automatic Vehicle Location	NO	SHSGP	F5	Information Technology								No hold indicated		28,150				28,150	28,150
C	Imasonic Tomograph Maintenance	04M-01-HOBL	Computer, Mobile Data	NO	SHSGP	F5	Information Technology								No hold indicated		1,725				1,725	1,725
C	(2) Dell Latitude E5300 Laptops	04M-01-HOBL	Computer, Mobile Data	NO	SHSGP	LE	Information Technology								No hold indicated		4,060				4,060	4,060
C	(4) CAD Software	04M-01-CJOS	Computer, Mobile Data	NO	SHSGP	LE	Information Technology								No hold indicated		6,500				6,500	6,500
C	(2) Annual Internet Air Cards	04M-02-05AD	Devices, Data Service Access	NO	SHSGP	LE	Information Technology								No hold indicated		1,440				1,440	1,440
D	(7) Structural Fire Fighting Protective Gear	01SF-01-FTHK	Structural Fire Fighting Protective Gear, NFPA 1971	NO	SHSGP	F5	Personal Protective Equipment								No hold indicated		1,500				1,500	1,500
D	(7) Structural Fire Fighting Protective Gear	01SF-01-CAHR	Structural Fire Fighting Protective Gear, NFPA 1971	NO	SHSGP	F5	Personal Protective Equipment								No hold indicated		11,378				11,378	11,378
D	(7) Structural Fire Fighting Protective Gear	01SF-01-GLDY	Structural Fire Fighting Protective Gear, NFPA 1971	NO	SHSGP	F5	Personal Protective Equipment								No hold indicated		500				500	500
D	(7) Structural Fire Fighting Protective Gear	01SF-02-HLMT	Structural Fire Fighting Protective Gear, NFPA 1971	NO	SHSGP	F5	Personal Protective Equipment								No hold indicated		1,600				1,600	1,600
D	(7) Structural Fire Fighting Protective Gear	01SF-01-HOOD	Structural Fire Fighting Protective Gear, NFPA 1971	NO	SHSGP	F5	Personal Protective Equipment								No hold indicated		250				250	250
D	(5) Self Contained Breathing Apparatus	01M-01-SCBA	SCBA, CBRN	NO	SHSGP	F5	Personal Protective Equipment								No hold indicated		25,712				25,712	25,712
E	(1) Annual Service - Theory First	04M-09-ALMT	Systems, PABX	YES	SHSGP	F5C	Communications Equipment								EP		116,580				116,580	116,580
F	(1) Fielding Award, Technicians	18M-00-KZFT	Wildfire	NO	SHSGP	LE	Communications Equipment								No hold indicated		179,383				179,383	179,383
F	(1) TASE DAD Airborne Imaging System and TLU	03OE-02-TLA	Thermal Imaging and/or LPR	NO	SHSGP	LE	Communications Equipment								No hold indicated		59,029				59,029	59,029
F	(1) Dell XTL Laptop Computer	04M-01-HOBL	Contractor Mobile Data	NO	SHSGP	LE	Communications Equipment								No hold indicated		3,013				3,013	3,013
F	(1) Dell XTL Laptop Computer	21GM-00-3WST	Installation	NO	SHSGP	LE	Communications Equipment								No hold indicated		7,742				7,742	7,742

**CALIFORNIA EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY  
TRAINING ROSTER**

**CFDA#** 97.067

**Tulare County**

107-00000

July 8, 2010

2010

<b>Ledger Types:</b>	<b>Initial Application</b>
<b>Today's date:</b>	<b>July 8, 2010</b>
<b>Expenditure Period:</b>	<b>(Date) From:</b>
	<b>(Date) To:</b>

Project	Course Name	Funding Source	Discipline	Solution Area Sub-Category	Feedback Number	Training Activity/Identified Host	EHP Approval Date	Estimated Cost	Amount Approved Previous	Amount This Request	Cash Request #	Total Approved	Remaining Balance
G	SEMS/NIMS/ICS Training	SHSGP	EMG	Training Consultant		Classroom Tulare County OES		23,270					15,000
G	SEMS Executive Training	SHSGP	EMG	Training Consultant		Classroom Tulare County OES		8,270					8,270